Tompkins County Highway Department

1;%%2%?4‘;*;%“ ROAD MATERIALS AND HIGHWAY SERVICES
Office : 607-274-0300 2025 BID RESULTS

highway@tompkins-co.org

JB-0000000109

CONTRACT PERIOD
April 1, 2025 - March 31, 2026 LOWEST UNIT PRICE BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

CONCRETE AND DE-ICING SAND

GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

PROCESSING ASPHALT MILLINGS

WARM MIX ASPHALT MATERIALS

WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

ACRYLIC WATERBORNE PAVEMENT MARKING - LONG LINES
INTERSECTION MARKING LINES, SYMBOLS AND LEGENDS - SHORT LINES
BRIDGE REPAIR

INFRASTRUCTURE CONSTRUCTION




2/20/2025, 9:36 AM

2025 - CONCRETE AND DE-ICING SAND

F.0.B. Materials ADDITIONAL PRICE PER TON FOR DELIVERY TO TOWN DELIVERY ZONES BELOW:
BIDDER ltem#1 | Item #2
NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a De-lcing | Concrete | . line| Danby | Dryden | Enfield | Groton | Ithaca | Lansing |Newfield | Ulysses
Unit Price / Ton bid are shown Sand Sand
(PERTON) | (PERTON)
OTOOLES STONE & GRAVEL $8.50 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI $9.00 $9.00 | $7.60 | $4.90 | $11.60 | $6.85 | $14.00 | $7.20 | $10.65 | $5.00 | $8.60
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGEL| * $8.10* | $8.10* | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $6.50 | NoBid | $8.70 | NoBid | $5.85 | $7.50
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC. (BROOKTONDALE) | $12.00 | $16.00 | $7.35 | $11.10 | $9.00 | $9.65 | $10.90 | $7.80 | $11.50 | $10.50 | $10.05
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC. (CANDOR) $15.00 | NoBid | $8.40 | $8.60 | $11.70 | $11.55 | $13.40 | $9.90 | $13.00 | $11.50 | $12.15
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC NoBid | $15.50 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL $9.00 | $2000 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. $9.00 | $21.45 | $12.50 | $12.50 | $17.00 | $16.00 | $19.00 | $16.00 | $20.00 | $15.75 | $18.75
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $1525 | $1825 | $8.00 | $11.00 | $7.00 | $13.50 | $7.00 | $9.50 | $8.00 | $14.00 | $17.00
HighBid| $15.25 | $21.45 | $12.50 | $12.50 | $17.00 | $16.00 | $19.00 | $16.00 | $20.00 | $15.75 | $18.75
LowBid| $8.50 $9.00 | $7.35 | $4.90 | $7.00 | $6.50 | $7.00 | $7.20 | $8.00 | $5.00 | $7.50
* NOT WASHED
BIDDER PIT LOCATION - FULL ADDRESS
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI 310 HILLVIEW DR, SPENCER NY 14883
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI RT 228 TERA BLVD ODESSA, NY
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC. 13 PERKINS RD BROOKTONDALE NY 14817
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC. 535 [THACA RD, CANDOR, NY 13743
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC 290 MOTT RD DRYDEN, NY 13053
OTOOLES STONE & GRAVEL 70 OAK HILL ROAD MORAVIA, NY 13118
BUCK PIT - 808 STANTON HILL ROAD NICHOLS, NY 13748
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. OWEGO PIT - 3944 WAVERLY ROAD OWEGO, NY 13827
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL 225 CODDINGTON RD, WILSEYVILLE, NY
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION 3779 RT 11, MCGRAW, NY 13101

CONCRETE & DE-ICING SAND 2025 Highway Materials and Services [2/34]



2/20/2025, 9:36 AM

2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

BIDDER CRUSHED STONE PRODUCTS (PER TON)
UNIT PRICE PER TON NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE PRICE NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE PRICE NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE PRICE NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE PRICE
1S SHOWN STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE
#1A #1A #1B #1B #1ST #1ST #1 #1
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEASTNY LLC $17.00 $24.50 No Bid $21.00 No Bid $24.50 $16.75 $22.50
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI $17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.00 No Bid
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.00 * No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * $10.75 * No Bid $10.75 * No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.00 * No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC $17.50 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $21.00 $35.00 $19.00 $35.00
(BROOKTONDALE) : ) : ) ) )
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE ) ) ) ) ) ) ) )
ANDREWS) ( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. $23.50 No Bid $26.00 No Bid $23.50 No Bid $19.50 No Bid
SENECA STONE CORPORATION No Bid $23.00 No Bid $23.00 No Bid $23.00 No Bid $23.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.00 No Bid $23.50 No Bid
High Bid $23.50 $35.00 $26.00 $23.00 $26.00 $35.00 $23.50 $35.00
Low Bid $17.00 $23.00 $26.00 $21.00 $21.00 $23.00 $14.00 $22.50
[ * NOT WASHED |
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2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM

BIDDER CRUSHED STONE PRODUCTS (PER TON)
NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE
NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE PRICE NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE PRICE NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE PRICE
UNIT PRICE PERTON STONE SIZE PRICE STONE SIZE PRICE
IS SHOWN STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE STONE SIZE Fa#2 STONE SIZE $2843 STONE SIZE
#2 #2 #3 #3 #4 #4
BLEND #1 & #2 BLEND BLEND #2 & #3 BLEND
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL $18.00 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC $15.25 $22.50 No Bid $22.50 No Bid $22.50 $17.50 $22.50 No Bid $23.35
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI $14.00 No Bid $14.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * $14.00 * No Bid $14.00 * No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.50 * No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * $13.50 * No Bid $14.00 * No Bid $22.00 * No Bid $13.50 * No Bid $14.00 * No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) $15.00 No Bid $13.50 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC $16.25 $34.00 $19.00 $34.00 No Bid $34.00 $19.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(BROOKTONDALE) ’ ) ’ ’ ’ ’
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE . . . . . .
( $15.00 No Bid $14.00 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid
ANDREWS)
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. $19.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SENECA STONE CORPORATION No Bid $22.00 No Bid $22.00 No Bid $23.00 No Bid $22.50 No Bid $22.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $23.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
High Bid $23.50 $34.00 $19.00 $34.00 $18.00 $34.00 $24.00 $22.50 $15.00 $23.35
Low Bid $14.00 $22.00 $13.50 $22.00 $18.00 $22.50 $14.60 $22.50 $15.00 $22.00
[ * NOT WASHED |
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GRAVEL & STONE MATERIALS

2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

BIDDER CRUSHED STONE PRODUCTS BIDDER INFO.
UNIT PRICE PERTON
PITLOCATION - FULLADDRESS NYSDOT SOURCE NUMBER NYSDOT LOCATION NUMBER
IS SHOWN
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL 70 OAK HILL ROAD MORAVIA, NY 13118 2451 74-2-A-12
NATIVE : 290 MOTT ROAD DRYDEN, NY 13053 NATIVE : 3-45-F NATIVE : GSNO1955

HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC

LIMESTONE : 4800 STATE STREET ELBRIDGE, NY 13060

LIMESTONE : 3-9-RI

LIMESTONE : H0135

ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI 310 HILLVIEW RD, SPENCER NY 14883 3978 66-9-V-21
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * RT 228 TERA BLVD ODESSA, NY 4346 60-6-M-28
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * 535 ITHACA ROAD CANDOR, NY 13743 GSN04100 75-8-M-30
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) 205 LAKE ROAD SPENCER, NY 14883 GSN03530 76-1-A-5
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC 13 PERKINS ROAD BROOKTONDALE, NY 14817 GSN02674 75-5-D-16
(BROOKTONDALE) !
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE
285 CODDINGTON ROAD WILLSEYVILLE, NY 13864 GSN10804 NO INFO
ANDREWS)
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL 225 CODDINGTON ROAD, WILSEYVILLE, NY 09-084F, G 09-084F, G
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. Buck Pit 808 Stanton Hill Road Nichols, NY 13748 6-72F, G 6-72F, G
Owego Pit - 3944 Waverly Road Owego, NY 13827 6-38F, G 6-38F, G
SENECA STONE CORPORATION 2747 CANOGA ROAD SENECA FALLS, NY 13148 3-4R GSN02598
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION 3779 RT 11 McGRAW, NY 13101 3-20G HO0061, H0237

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM
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2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

BIDDER CRUSHER RUN (PERTON) GRAVEL PRODUCTS (PERTON) BANK RUN GRAVEL (PER TON)
UNIT PRICE PER TON NATIVE PRICE LIMESTONE PRICE NATIVE PRICE NATIVE PRICE NATIVE PRICE NATIVE PRICE
1S SHOWN TYPE2 TYPE 2 TYPE4 TYPE4 BANK RUN SCREENED
CRUSHER RUN CRUSHER RUN SCREENED CRUSHED GRAVEL BANK RUN
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL $17.50 No Bid $7.50 $9.00 $7.50 $7.50
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC $10.00 $14.25 No Bid No Bid $9.25 No Bid
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI $13.50 No Bid $6.25 $8.40 $6.25 $6.25
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * No Bid No Bid $4.60 $8.40 $5.40 $4.60
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * No Bid No Bid $6.50 $8.25 $6.75 $7.00
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) $13.75 No Bid $6.00 $8.25 $6.75 $7.00
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC $18.50 $24.75 $11.00 $12.00 $11.00 $11.25
(BROOKTONDALE) ) : ’ ’ ’ ’
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE )
13.75 No Bid 6.00 8.25 6.75 7.00

ANDREWS) $ o8l $ $ $ $
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid $6.00 $12.50 $6.00 $6.00
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. $7.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid
SENECA STONE CORPORATION No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

High Bid $18.50 $24.75 $11.00 $12.50 $11.00 $11.25

Low Bid $7.50 $14.00 $4.60 $8.25 $5.40 $4.60

GRAVEL & STONE MATERIALS

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM
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GRAVEL & STONE MATERIALS

2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

BIDDER CRUSHER RUN, NATIVE TYPE 4, AND BANK RUN BIDDER INFO.
UNIT PRICE PERTON NYSDOT LOCATION
PIT LOCATION - FULLADDRESS NYSDOT SOURCE NUMBER
ISSHOWN NUMBER
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL 70 OAK HILL ROAD MORAVIA, NY 13118 2451 74-2-A-12
NATIVE : 290 MOTT ROAD DRYDEN, NY 13053 NATIVE : 3-45-F NATIVE : GSNO1955

HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEASTNY LLC

LIMESTONE : 4800 STATE STREET ELBRIDGE, NY 13060

LIMESTONE : 3-9-RI

LIMESTONE : H0135

ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI 310 HILLVIEW RD, SPENCER NY 14883 3978 66-9-V-21
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * RT 228 TERA BLVD ODESSA, NY 4346 60-6-M-28
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * 535 ITHACA ROAD CANDOR, NY 13743 GSN04100 75-8-M-30
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) 205 LAKE ROAD SPENCER, NY 14883 GSN03530 76-1-A-5
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC 13 PERKINS ROAD BROOKTONDALE, NY 14817 GSN02674 75-5-D-16
(BROOKTONDALE)
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE

285 CODDINGTON ROAD WILLSEYVILLE, NY 13864 GSN10804 NOINFO
ANDREWS)
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL 225 CODDINGTON ROAD, WILSEYVILLE, NY 09-084F, G 09-084F, G

F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC.

Buck Pit - 808 Stanton Hill Road Nichols, NY 13748
Owego Pit - 3944 Waverly Road Owego, NY 13827

6-72F, G6-38F, G

6-72F, G6-38F, G

SENECA STONE CORPORATION

Owego Pit - 3944 Waverly Road Owego, NY 13827

3-4R

GSN02598

SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION

3779 RT 11 McGRAW, NY 13101

3-20G

H0061, H0237

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM
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2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

BIDDER STONE FILLING AND RIP-RAP (PER TON)
UNIT PRICE PER TON NATIVE LIMESTONE NATIVE LIMESTONE NATIVE LIMESTONE NATIVE LIMESTONE
1S SHOWN PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
LIGHT LIGHT FINE FINE MEDIUM MEDIUM HEAVY HEAVY
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL $20.00 No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC No Bid $28.00 No Bid $28.00 No Bid $34.55 No Bid $45.35
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI $30.00 No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * $16.00 No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) $16.00 No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC $21.00 $45.00 $19.00 $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(BROOKTONDALE) ’ ’ ) )
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE ) ) ) ) ) )
ANDREWS) ( $16.00 No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. $20.00 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $30.00 No Bid $35.00 No Bid
SENECA STONE CORPORATION No Bid $30.00 No Bid $25.00 No Bid $35.00 No Bid $45.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
High Bid $30.00 $45.00 $30.00 $45.00 $30.00 $35.00 $35.00 $45.35
Low Bid $16.00 $28.00 $14.00 $25.00 $30.00 $34.55 $35.00 $45.00

GRAVEL & STONE MATERIALS

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM
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GRAVEL & STONE MATERIALS

2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

BIDDER STONE FILLING AND RIP-RAP (PER TON)
NATIVE LIMESTONE NATIVE LIMESTONE NATIVE LIMESTONE
UNIT PRICE PER TON PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
IS SHOWN SELECT SELECT AVERAGE RUN AVEAGE RUN GABION GABION
RIP-RAP RIP-RAP RIP-RAP RIP-RAP STONE STONE
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.00 $32.00
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC No Bid $59.50 No Bid $34.00 No Bid $28.00
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(BROOKTONDALE)
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE . ) . ) . )
ANDREWS) ( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. $40.00 No Bid $25.00 No Bid $20.00 No Bid
SENECA STONE CORPORATION No Bid $70.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
High Bid $40.00 $70.00 $25.00 $34.00 $20.00 $32.00
Low Bid $40.00 $59.50 $25.00 $34.00 $16.00 $25.00

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM
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GRAVEL & STONE MATERIALS

2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

BIDDER STONE FILLING AND RIP-RAP BIDDER INFO.
UNIT PRICE PER TON
PITLOCATION - FULL ADDRESS NYSDOT SOURCENUMBER | NYSDOT LOCATION NUMBER
1S SHOWN
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL 70 OAK HILL ROAD MORAVIA, NY 13118 2451 74-2-A-12
NATIVE : 290 MOTT ROAD DRYDEN, NY 13053 NATIVE : 3-45-F NATIVE : GSNO1955

HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEASTNY LLC

LIMESTONE : 4800 STATE STREET ELBRIDGE, NY 13060

LIMESTONE : 3-9-RI

LIMESTONE : H0135

ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI 310 HILLVIEW DR, SPENCER NY 14883 3978 66-9-V-21
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * RT 228 TERA BLVD ODESSA, NY 4346 60-6-M-28
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * 535 ITHACA ROAD CANDOR, NY 13743 GSN04100 NO INFO
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) 205 LAKE ROAD SPENCER, NY 14883 GSN03530 76-1-A-5
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC 13 PERKINS ROAD BROOKTONDALE, NY 14817 GSN02674 75-5-D-16
(BROOKTONDALE) ’
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE
285 CODDINGTON ROAD WILLSEYVILLE, NY 13864 GSN10804 NO INFO
ANDREWS)
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid
Birchardville - 1 tewart R
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. ircharaville - 1358 Stewart Road 9-42-R 9-42-R
Montrose, PA 18834
SENECA STONE CORPORATION 2747 CANOGA ROAD SENECA FALLS, NY 13148 3-4R GSN02598
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION 3779 RT 11 McGRAW, NY 13101 3-20G HO0061, H0237

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM
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2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM

GRAVEL & CRUSHED STONE
BIDDER ADDITIONAL PRICE PER TON FOR DELIVERY TO TOWN DELIVERY ZONES BELOW:
UNIT PRICE PERTON Caroline Danb Dryden Enfield Groton Ithaca Lansin; Newfield Ulysses
IS SHOWN v y g y
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI $7.60 $4.90 $11.60 $6.85 $14.00 $7.20 $10.65 $5.00 $8.60
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.50 No Bid $8.70 No Bid $5.85 $7.50
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * $8.40 $8.60 $11.70 $11.55 $13.40 $9.90 $13.00 $11.50 $12.15
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) $13.10 $9.20 $13.20 $10.50 $15.70 $10.05 $12.35 $8.60 $10.90
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC
7. 11.1 X . 10. 7. 11. 10. 10.
(BROOKTONDALE) $7.35 $11.10 $9.00 $9.65 $10.90 $7.80 $11.50 $10.50 $10.50
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE
$7.55 $9.20 $10.70 $11.10 $11.95 $9.00 $12.15 $12.15 $11.50
ANDREWS)
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. $12.50 $12.50 $16.00 $17.00 $19.00 $16.00 $20.00 $15.75 $18.75
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $14.75 $13.75 $15.00 $12.00 $15.25 $12.50 $13.25 $13.00 $11.25
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $8.00 $11.00 $7.00 $13.50 $7.00 $9.50 $8.00 $14.00 $17.00
High Bid $14.75 $13.75 $16.00 $17.00 $19.00 $16.00 $20.00 $15.75 $18.75
Low Bid $7.35 $4.90 $7.00 $6.50 $7.00 $7.20 $8.00 $5.00 $7.50

GRAVEL & STONE MATERIALS

2025 Highway Materials and Services
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2/20/2025, 9:36 AM

2025 - GRAVEL AND STONE PRODUCTS

STONE FILLING & RIP-RAP
BIDDER ADDITIONAL PRICE PER TON FOR DELIVERY TO TOWN DELIVERY ZONES BELOW:
UNIT PRICE PERTON Caroline Danb Dryden Enfield Groton Ithaca Lansin; Newfield Ulysses
IS SHOWN v v g y
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR) * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC _ . ) . : . : . :
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(BROOKTONDALE)
H.L. ROBINSON SAND RAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE
OBINSON S &6 INC( S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ANDREWS)
AUSTIN SAND & GRAVEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING, INC. $17.00 $17.00 $21.00 $22.50 $22.50 $21.50 $25.00 $21.00 $24.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $23.00 $21.50 $23.00 $18.50 $24.50 $20.00 $20.00 $21.50 $17.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
High Bid $23.00 $21.50 $23.00 $22.50 $24.50 $21.50 $25.00 $21.50 $24.00
Low Bid $17.00 $17.00 $21.00 $18.50 $22.50 $20.00 $20.00 $21.00 $17.00

GRAVEL & STONE MATERIALS 2025 Highway Materials and Services [12/34]
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2025 - LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

BITUMINOUS MATERIALS
ITEM#1 ITEM#2 ITEM#3 ITEM#4 ITEM#5 ITEM#6 ITEM#7 ITEM#8 ITEM#9 ITEM#10
BID PRICE PER GALLON
RS-2 HFRS-2 CRS-2 HFMS-2ST CMS-2ST RS-2P HFRS-2P CRS-2P MS-2 HFMS-2

CATEGORY A
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $2.410 $2.440 $3.680 $2.920 $4.130 $2.670 $2.156 $3.940 $3.050 $3.090
VESTAL ASPHALT $2.177 $2.238 $2.370 $2.750 $2.800 $2.266 $2.318 $2.570 $2.850 $2.900

High Bid $2.410 $2.440 $3.680 $2.920 $4.130 $2.670 $2.318 $3.940 $3.050 $3.090

Low Bid $2.177 $2.238 $2.370 $2.750 $2.800 $2.266 $2.156 $2.570 $2.850 $2.900

Liquid Bituminous Materials 2025 Highway Materials and Services [13/34]
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2025 - LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

ITEM # 25
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS ITEM #24
BID PRICE PER GALLON ITEM#11 ITEM#12 ITEM#13 ITEM#14 ITEM#15 ITEM# 16 ITEM#17 ITEM #21 Hvper Patch Modified Liquid
CMS-2 HFMS-2Gh TACK COAT AEP-M CPE-WS CPE-SS HFMS-2GWS HFMS-2h yp. . Patch
CATEGORY A Liquid SKMOD
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $4.130 $3.030 $10.540 $2.390 $3.620 $3.570 $3.580 $3.140 $6.500 $4.700
VESTAL ASPHALT $3.000 $2.800 $10.000 $2.400 $3.650 $3.500 $3.450 $2.950 $4.500 No Bid
High Bid $4.130 $3.030 $10.540 $2.400 $3.650 $3.570 $3.580 $3.140 $6.500 $4.700
Low Bid $3.000 $2.800 $10.000 $2.390 $3.620 $3.500 $3.450 $2.950 $4.500 $4.700

Liquid Bituminous Materials 2025 Highway Materials and Services [14/34]



2025 - LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM

ITEM #29
CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT ITEM # 27 ITEM # 31 ITEM #32 COLD
ITEM # 28 SELF PROPELLED ITEM # 30 TWIN
BID PRICE PER DAY RENTAL ITEM # 26 PUGMILL VIBRATORY PNEUMATIC RECYCLER/
AUTOMATED PAVER (W/| VARIABLE WIDTH DRUM VIBRATORY
(WITH OPERATORS) (W/ OPER.) SHEEPSFOOT ROLLER RUBBER TIRE ROLLER STABILIZER /
20PER.) AGGREGATE ROLLER
CATEGORY B (W/ OPER.) (W/ OPER) REPROFILER
SPREADER
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $2,500.000 $2,600.000 $3,600.000 $2,300.000 $2,450.000 $2,200.000 $6,700.000
VESTAL ASPHALT $3,000.000 $3,000.000 $4,000.000 $2,500.000 $2,500.000 $2,300.000 $7,000.000
High Bid $3,000.000 $3,000.000 $4,000.000 $2,500.000 $2,500.000 $2,300.000 $7,000.000
Low Bid $2,500.000 $2,600.000 $3,600.000 $2,300.000 $2,450.000 $2,200.000 $6,700.000
BID PRICES ARE REQUESTED FOR RENTAL, PER DAY, FOR THE EQUIPMENT ABOVE IN CONJUNCTION WITH LIQUID ASPHALT PROJECTS.
EQUIPMENT RENTAL IS CONSIDERED INCIDENTAL TO LIQUID PRODUCTS AND IS NOT A BASIS FOR AWARD.
Liquid Bituminous Materials 2025 Highway Materials and Services [15/34]



2025 - PROCESSING ASPHALT MILLINGS

MOBILIZATION PROCESSING OPTIONAL ITEMS
BIDDER ($/PER ASPHALT LOADER COMBINED -
STOCKPILE MILLINGS W/OPERATOR PROJECT
LOCATION) ($/TON) ($/TON) COST
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL $5,500.00 $5.00 $1.50 $5,506.50
High Bid $5,506.50
Low Bid $5,506.50
BIDDER BUSINESS LOCATION - FULL ADDRESS
O'TOOLES STONE & GRAVEL 70 OAK HILL ROAD MORAVIA, NY 13118

Processing Asphalt Millings

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025,9:36 AM
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT MATERIALS
NET PRICE PER ENGLISH TON

F.0.B. Materials - at Bidder’s Location, $ Per Net English Ton:

2/20/2025, 9:36 AM

BIDDER 6.3mm F2 6.3mmF3 9.5 mm F2 9.5mmF3 0.5 mm Fo TRUE & LEVELING
Only Vendors submitting a TOP COURSE TOP COURSE TOP COURSE TOP COURSE ’ mmo 062t PGB /¢
Unit Price /Ton bid are shown (0.067t PGB / t) (0.067t PGB / t) (0.062t PGB / t) (0.062t PGB / t) (o )
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS PRODUCTS, INC $79.00 $79.00 $76.00 $76.00 $76.00
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $81.70 $81.70 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC $81.95 $81.95 $80.65 $80.65 $78.50
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $84.00 $84.00 $78.00 $78.00 $76.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $85.00 $85.00 $76.15 $76.15 $76.15

High Bid $85.00 $85.00 $80.65 $80.65 $80.00

Low Bid $79.00 $79.00 $76.00 $76.00 $76.00

WARM MIX ASPHALT - MATERIALS

2025 Highway Materials and Services
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT MATERIALS

NET PRICE PER ENGLISH TON
F.0.B. Materials - at Bidder’s Location, $ Per Net English Tor

BIDDER 12.5mmF2 12.5mmF3 12.5 mm F9 TRUE &
. P COURSE 0P COURSE LEVELING 19 mm F9 BINDER COURSE | 25 mm F9 BINDER COURSE | 37.5 mm F9 BASE COURSE

Only Vendors submitting a T (0.049t PGB /1) (0.045t PGB /1) (0.040t PGB /1)

Unit Price /Ton bid are shown (0.055t PGB / 1) (0.055t PGB / 1) (0.055t PGB / 1)

BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS PRODUCTS, INC $72.00 $72.00 $72.00 $71.00 $69.00 $68.00

ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $79.20 $79.20 $79.20 $76.75 $72.00 $70.75

HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC $80.55 $80.55 $78.60 $71.40 $68.15 $66.75

SENECA STONE CORPORATION $75.00 $75.00 $73.00 $67.00 $64.00 $63.00

SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $72.90 $72.90 $72.90 $66.75 $64.75 $62.50
High Bid $80.55 $80.55 $79.20 $76.75 $72.00 $70.75
Low Bid $72.00 $72.00 $72.00 $66.75 $64.00 $62.50

WARM MIX ASPHALT - MATERIALS 2025 Highway Materials and Services
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT MATERIALS

NET PRICE PER ENGLISH TON
F.0.B. Materials - at Bidder’s Location, $ Per Net English Tor

ADDITIONAL PRICE PER TON FOR DELIVERY ON VENDOR'S TRUCK TO TOWN DELIVERY ZONES:
BIDDER
Only Vendors submitting a Caroline Danby Dryden Enfield Groton Ithaca Lansing Newfield Ulysses
Unit Price /Ton bid are shown
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS PRODUCTS, INC $11.75 $11.25 $9.75 $16.50 $11.75 $13.50 $15.50 $13.50 $23.00
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $18.75 $15.00 $20.00 $12.25 $20.00 $11.25 $17.35 $9.20 $13.00
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SENECA STONE CORPORATION No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $8.00 $11.00 $7.00 $13.50 $7.00 $9.50 $8.00 $14.00 $17.00
High Bid $18.75 $15.00 $20.00 $16.50 $20.00 $13.50 $17.35 $14.00 $23.00
Low Bid $8.00 $11.00 $7.00 $12.25 $7.00 $9.50 $8.00 $9.20 $13.00
WARM MIX ASPHALT - MATERIALS 2025 Highway Materials and Services
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT MATERIALS

NET PRICE PER ENGLISH TON
F.0.B. Materials - at Bidder’s Location, $ Per Net English Tor

BIDDER

Only Vendors submitting a PIT LOCATION - FULL ADDRESS
Unit Price /Ton bid are shown

BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS PRODUCTS, INC 3818 STRT 17C TIOGA, NY 13845

ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC 1 COUNTY RD 77A HORSEHEADS, NY 14845
HEIDELBERG MATERIALS NORTHEAST NY LLC 4800 STATE RT 321 SKANEATELES, NY 13152

SENECA STONE CORPORATION 2747 CANOGA ROAD SENECA, NY 13148

SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION 3779 RT 11 McGRAW, NY 13101

WARM MIX ASPHALT - MATERIALS 2025 Highway Materials and Services [20/34]
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

City of Ithaca

BIDDER 9.5 mm F9 12.5 mm F9 19 mm Fo 25 mm F PRODUCTION ASPHALT
o 6.3mm F2TOP | 6.3 mm F3TOP [ 9.5 mm F2TOP TRUE & 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACK COAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER BASE COURSE | (PER GALLON) COLD MILLING INSPECTION

COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS )
PRODUCTS ING $110.00 $110.00 $108.00 $109.00 $105.00 $105.00 $107.00 $104.00 $128.00 $128.00 $4.50 $4.50 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $98.75 $98.75 $97.75 $97.75 $95.25 $95.25 $95.25 $91.75 $89.45 $87.00 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $103.00 $103.00 $97.00 $95.00 $94.00 $94.00 $92.00 $86.00 $83.00 $82.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $123.00 $123.00 $118.00 $118.00 $117.00 $117.00 $117.00 $106.00 $104.00 $102.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
HighBid| $123.00 $123.00 $118.00 $118.00 $117.00 $117.00 $117.00 $106.00 $128.00 $128.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
Low Bid $98.75 $98.75 $97.00 $95.00 $94.00 $94.00 $92.00 $86.00 $83.00 $82.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00

WARM MIX ASPHALT PAVING 2025 Highway Materials and Services [21/34]
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Ithaca

BIDDER 9.5 mm F9 12.5 mm F9 ASPHALT
19 mm F9 25 mm F9 PRODUCTION
o 6.3mm F2TOP | 6.3 mm F3TOP [ 9.5 mm F2TOP TRUE & 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACK COAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER BASE COURSE | (PER GALLON) COLD MILLING INSPECTION
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS
PRODUCTS ING $108.00 $108.00 $106.00 $107.00 $103.00 $103.00 $104.00 $102.00 $126.00 $126.00 $4.50 $4.50 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $98.75 $98.75 $97.75 $97.75 $95.25 $95.25 $95.25 $91.75 $89.45 $87.00 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $103.00 $103.00 $97.00 $95.00 $94.00 $94.00 $92.00 $86.00 $83.00 $82.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $123.00 $123.00 $118.00 $118.00 $117.00 $117.00 $117.00 $106.00 $104.00 $102.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
HighBid| $123.00 $123.00 $118.00 $118.00 $117.00 $117.00 $117.00 $106.00 $126.00 $126.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
Low Bid $98.75 $98.75 $97.00 $95.00 $94.00 $94.00 $92.00 $86.00 $83.00 $82.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00

WARM MIX ASPHALT PAVING 2025 Highway Materials and Services [22/34]
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Caroline

9.5 mm F9 12.5mm F9 ASPHALT
BIDDER 19 mm F9 25 mm F9 PRODUCTION
o 6.3mmF2TOP[6.3mmF3TOP|9.5mmF2TOP| TRUE& 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACKCOAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER | ¢ ASE COURSE (PER GALLON) COLDMILLING | -\ <pecTioN
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS
PRODUCTS INC $106.00 $106.00 $104.00 $105.00 $101.00 $101.00 $102.00 $100.00 $123.00 $123.00 $4.50 $4.50 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $104.75 $104.75 $104.00 $104.00 $101.25 $101.25 $101.25 $97.75 $95.45 $93.00 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $107.00 $107.00 $101.00 $99.00 $98.00 $98.00 $96.00 $90.00 $87.00 $86.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $113.00 $113.00 $108.00 $108.00 $116.00 $116.00 $116.00 $97.00 $95.00 $93.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
HighBid| $113.00 $113.00 $108.00 $108.00 $116.00 $116.00 $116.00 $100.00 $123.00 $123.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
LowBid] $104.75 $104.75 $101.00 $99.00 $98.00 $98.00 $96.00 $90.00 $87.00 $86.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Danby
BIDDER 9.5 mm F9 12.5mm F9 19 mm F9 25 mm F9 pRODUCTION | ASPHALT
o 6.3mmF2TOP[6.3mmF3TOP|9.5mmF2TOP| TRUE& 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACKCOAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER | ¢ ASE COURSE (PER GALLON) COLDMILLING | -\ <pecTioN
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS
PRODUCTS INC $106.00 $106.00 $105.00 $106.00 $103.00 $103.00 $102.00 $102.00 $127.00 $127.00 $4.50 $4.50 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $103.00 $103.00 $101.75 $101.75 $99.25 $99.25 $99.25 $95.75 $93.45 $91.00 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $105.00 $105.00 $99.00 $97.00 $96.00 $96.00 $94.00 $88.00 $85.00 $84.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $124.00 $124.00 $119.00 $119.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $117.00 $115.00 $113.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
HighBid| $124.00 $124.00 $119.00 $119.00 $118.00 $118.00 $118.00 $117.00 $127.00 $127.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
Low Bid] $103.00 $103.00 $99.00 $97.00 $96.00 $96.00 $94.00 $88.00 $85.00 $84.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Dryden

9.5 mm F9 12.5 mm F9 ASPHALT
BIDDER 19 mm F9 25 mm F9 PRODUCTION
o 6.3mm F2TOP | 6.3 mm F3TOP [ 9.5 mm F2TOP TRUE & 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACK COAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER BASE COURSE | (PER GALLON) COLD MILLING INSPECTION
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS
PRODUCTS ING $102.00 $102.00 $99.00 $100.00 $99.00 $100.00 $100.00 $93.00 $97.00 $97.00 $4.50 $3.50 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $106.00 $106.00 $105.00 $105.00 $103.00 $103.00 $103.00 $99.00 $96.95 $94.25 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $114.00 $114.00 $108.00 $106.00 $105.00 $105.00 $103.00 $97.00 $94.00 $93.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $111.00 $111.00 $106.00 $106.00 $104.00 $104.00 $104.00 $94.00 $92.00 $90.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
High Bid|] $114.00 $114.00 $108.00 $106.00 $105.00 $105.00 $104.00 $99.00 $97.00 $97.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
LowBid] $102.00 $102.00 $99.00 $100.00 $99.00 $100.00 $100.00 $93.00 $92.00 $90.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Groton

BIDDER 9.5 mm F9 12.5mm F9 ASPHALT
19 mm F9 25 mmF9 PRODUCTION
o 6.3mmF2TOP[6.3mmF3TOP|9.5mmF2TOP| TRUE& 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACKCOAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER | ¢ ASE COURSE (PER GALLON) COLDMILLING | -\ <pecTioN
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS
PRODUCTS INC $106.00 $106.00 $104.00 $104.00 $101.00 $101.00 $102.00 $99.00 $131.00 $131.00 $4.50 $4.00 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $107.00 $107.00 $106.00 $106.00 $103.50 $103.50 $103.50 $100.00 $97.75 $95.25 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $114.00 $114.00 $108.00 $106.00 $105.00 $105.00 $103.00 $97.00 $94.00 $93.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $113.00 $113.00 $108.00 $108.00 $107.00 $107.00 $107.00 $97.00 $95.00 $93.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
HighBid| $114.00 $114.00 $108.00 $108.00 $107.00 $107.00 $107.00 $100.00 $131.00 $131.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
Low Bid] $106.00 $106.00 $104.00 $104.00 $101.00 $101.00 $102.00 $97.00 $94.00 $93.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Lansing

BIDDER 9.5 mm F9 12.5mm F9 19 mm F9 25 mm F9 pRODUCTION | ASPHALT
o 6.3mmF2TOP[6.3mmF3TOP|9.5mmF2TOP| TRUE& 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACKCOAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER | ¢ ASE COURSE (PER GALLON) COLDMILLING | -\ <pecTioN
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS ]
PRSSUCTS ING $111.00 $111.00 $110.00 $111.00 $106.00 $106.00 $107.00 $105.00 $136.00 $136.00 $4.50 $4.50 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $104.75 $104.75 $104.00 $104.00 $101.25 $101.25 $101.25 $98.20 $98.20 $94.00 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $104.00 $104.00 $98.00 $96.00 $95.00 $95.00 $93.00 $87.00 $84.00 $83.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $115.00 $115.00 $109.00 $109.00 $107.00 $107.00 $107.00 $97.00 $95.00 $93.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
HighBid| $115.00 $115.00 $110.00 $111.00 $107.00 $107.00 $107.00 $105.00 $136.00 $136.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
Low Bid] $104.00 $104.00 $98.00 $96.00 $95.00 $95.00 $93.00 $87.00 $84.00 $83.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00

WARM MIX ASPHALT PAVING 2025 Highway Materials and Services [27/34]



2/20/2025, 9:36 AM

2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Newfield

9.5 mm F9 12.5 mm F9 ASPHALT
BIDDER 19 mm F9 25 mm F9 PRODUCTION
o 6.3mm F2TOP | 6.3 mm F3TOP [ 9.5 mm F2TOP TRUE & 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACK COAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER BASE COURSE | (PER GALLON) COLD MILLING INSPECTION
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS
PRODUCTS ING $108.00 $108.00 $107.00 $107.00 $102.00 $102.00 $102.00 $101.00 $122.00 $122.00 $4.50 $4.00 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $97.75 $97.75 $96.75 $96.75 $94.25 $94.25 $94.25 $90.75 $88.45 $86.00 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $101.00 $101.00 $95.00 $93.00 $92.00 $92.00 $90.00 $84.00 $81.00 $80.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $129.00 $129.00 $125.00 $125.00 $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $112.00 $110.00 $108.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
HighBid| $129.00 $129.00 $125.00 $125.00 $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $112.00 $122.00 $122.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
Low Bid $97.75 $97.75 $95.00 $93.00 $92.00 $92.00 $90.00 $84.00 $81.00 $80.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Ulysses
BIDDER 9.5 mm F9 12.5mm F9 19 mm F9 25 mm F9 pRODUCTION | ASPHALT
o 6.3mmF2TOP[6.3mmF3TOP|9.5mmF2TOP| TRUE& 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACKCOAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER | ¢ ASE COURSE (PER GALLON) COLDMILLING | -\ <pecTioN
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS )
PRODUCTS INC $118.00 $118.00 $114.00 $115.00 $109.00 $109.00 $110.00 $107.00 $143.00 $143.00 $4.50 $4.50 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $102.75 $102.75 $101.75 $101.75 $99.25 $99.25 $99.25 $95.75 $93.60 $91.00 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $99.00 $99.00 $93.00 $91.00 $90.00 $90.00 $88.00 $82.00 $79.00 $78.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $132.00 $132.00 $127.00 $127.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $115.00 $113.00 $111.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
High Bid|] $132.00 $132.00 $127.00 $127.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $115.00 $143.00 $143.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
LowBid] $99.00 $99.00 $93.00 $91.00 $90.00 $90.00 $88.00 $82.00 $79.00 $78.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00
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2025 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - PAVING

Town of Enfield

BIDDER 9.5 mm F9 12.5 mm F9 19 mm Fo 25 mm F PRODUCTION ASPHALT
o 6.3mm F2TOP | 6.3 mm F3TOP [ 9.5 mm F2TOP TRUE & 125mmF2 | 12.5mmF3 TRUE & 37.5mmF9 | TACK COAT PAVING
Unit Price /Ton COURSE COURSE COURSE LEVELING | TOP COURSE | TOP COURSE | LEVELING BINDER BINDER BASE COURSE | (PER GALLON) COLD MILLING INSPECTION
COURSE COURSE (PER SQ YARD)
COURSE COURSE (PER DAY)
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS )
PRODUCTS ING $111.00 $111.00 $108.00 $109.00 $105.00 $105.00 $106.00 $104.00 $132.00 $132.00 $4.50 $4.50 No Bid
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIALS LLC $99.75 $99.75 $98.75 $98.75 $96.25 $96.25 $96.25 $93.20 $90.45 $91.00 $2.75 $4.57 $1,575.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION $100.00 $100.00 $94.00 $92.00 $91.00 $91.00 $89.00 $83.00 $80.00 $79.00 $5.00 $1.50 $1,000.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION $130.00 $130.00 $125.00 $125.00 $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $112.00 $110.00 $108.00 $8.50 $1.40 $1,350.00
High Bid| $130.00 $130.00 $125.00 $125.00 $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $112.00 $132.00 $132.00 $8.50 $4.57 $1,575.00
Low Bid $99.75 $99.75 $94.00 $92.00 $91.00 $91.00 $89.00 $83.00 $80.00 $79.00 $2.75 $1.40 $1,000.00
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2025 - ACRYLIC WATERBORNE PAVEMENT MARKING - LONG LINES

Mobilization to Tompkins County, * one time for bid purposes, two or three times anticipated.

BIDDER
Bid Items ACCENT STRIPE, INC.
ITEM 1A - DOUBLE CENTERLINE UNIT PRICE
$575.00
($ PER CENTERLINE MILE)
ITEM 1B - DOUBLE CENTERLINE ESTIMATE FOR 220 MILES
$126,500.00
($ PER 220 MILES)
ITEM 2A - SINGLE EDGELINE UNIT PRICE
$349.00
($ PER EDGELINE MILE)
ITEM 2B - SINGLE EDGELINE ESTIMATE FOR 150 MILES
$52,350.00
($ PER 150 MILES)
ITEM 3 - YELLOW AEXCEL TRAFFIC PAINT ($ PER GALLON) No Bid
ITEM 3 - YELLOW BALTIMORE TRAFFIC PAINT ($ PER GALLON) $13.00
ITEM 4 - WHITE AEXCEL TRAFFIC PAINT ($ PER GALLON) No Bid
ITEM 4 - WHITE BALTIMORE TRAFFIC PAINT ($ PER GALLON) $13.00
ITEM 5 - REFLECTORIZED GLASS BEADS ($ PER POUND) $0.55
ITEM 6 - MOBILIZATION - TEN MILES OR LESS $2,500.00
TOTAL OF ITEMS 1B, 2B, 6. $181,350.00

Acrylic Waterborne Marking

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025,9:36 AM
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2025 - INTERSECTION MARKING LINES, SYMBOLS AND LEGENDS - SHORT LINES

BIDDER

CITYMARK STRIPING LLC

Quantity for

Bid Items Estimates Unit Prices Estimates

ITEM1 24” WIDTH STOP BAR ($ PERLN. FT.) (808 Ln.ft.) $3.50 $2,828.00
ITEM 2 4” WIDTH RADIUS/STRAIGHT LINES ($ PER LN. FT.) (26,800 Ln.ft.) $0.70 $18,760.00
ITEM3 STRAIGHT ARROW (EACH) (6 each) $125.00 $750.00
ITEM 4 LEFT/RIGHT CURVE ARROW (EACH) (17 each) $150.00 $2,550.00
ITEM5 STRAIGHT & CURVE COMBO ARROW (EACH) (2 each) $250.00 $500.00
ITEM6 LEGEND - O-N-L-Y (EACH) (8 each) $200.00 $1,600.00
ITEM7 6” CROSSWALK LINES ($ PER LN. FT.) (70 Ln.ft.) $1.20 $84.00
ITEM8 8” CROSSWALK LINES ($ PERLN. FT.) (100 Ln.ft.) $1.40 $140.00
ITEM9 12” CROSSWALK & DIAGONAL LINES ($ PERLN. FT.) (2,500 Ln.ft.) $2.10 $5,250.00
ITEM10 24” CROSSWALK & DIAGONAL LINES ($ PERLN. FT.) (1,500 Ln.ft.) $4.20 $6,300.00
ITEM 11 RAIL ROAD GRADE CROSSING (EACH) (4 each) $514.50 $2,058.00
ITEM12 4” WIDE CENTERLINE ($ PER LN. FT.) (7,400 Ln.ft.) $0.70 $5,180.00
ITEM 13 24” WIDE DIAGONAL LINES ($ PERLN. FT.) (1,000 Ln.ft.) $4.50 $4,500.00
ESTIMATE TOTALS $50,500.00

Intersection Markings

2025 Highway Materials and Services

2/20/2025,9:36 AM
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2025 - BRIDGE REPAIR

2/20/2025,9:36 AM

BIDDER
. TOWN & COUNTY BRIDGE AND RAIL
Swarthout Recycling LLC
. INC
Quantity for
Bid Items Estimates Unit Prices Estimates Unit Prices Estimates
ITEMA MOBILIZATION (EACH JOB LOCATION) 1EACH No Bid No Bid $1,475.00 $1,475.00
ITEMB FOREMAN ($ PER HOUR) 120 HRS $102.00 No Bid $127.00 $15,240.00
ITEMC CARPENTER, IRONWORKER ($ PER HOUR) 240 HRS $101.00 No Bid $122.00 $29,280.00
ITEMD LABORER ($ PER HOUR) 240 HRS $85.00 No Bid $117.00 $28,080.00
ESTIMATE TOTALS No Bid $74,075.00
Bridge Repair 2025 Highway Materials and Services [33/34]



2025 - INFRASTRUCTURE CONSTRUCTION

2/20/2025,9:36 AM

SUIT-KOTE TOWN & COUNTY BRIDGE | | SWARTHOUT RECYCLING, SENECA STONE
BIDDER MOBILIZATION OPERATION MOBILIZATION OPERATION MOBILIZATION OPERATION MOBILIZATION OPERATION
LUMP HOUR LUMP HOUR LUMP HOUR LUMP HOUR
REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION STAFF
FOREMAN - $132.73 - $127.00 - $102.00 - No Bid
JOURNEYMAN CARPENTER - $95.83 - $122.00 - $101.00 = No Bid
IRON WORKER - $96.45 - $122.00 - No Bid - No Bid
LABORER - $91.33 - $117.00 - $85.00 - $81.00
EQUIPMENT OPERATOR - $132.67 - $157.00 - $95.00 - $92.00
EQUIPMENT RIGGER - $96.45 - $122.00 - $90.00 = No Bid
SURVEYOR / LAYOUT / DRAFTSMAN - $119.17 - $177.00 - No Bid - No Bid
REQUIRED HEAVY HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT
TRACK EXCAVATOR WITH THUMB (20 TON) $2,000 $267.97 $1,500.00 |  $275.00 $500 $175.00 No Bid No Bid
TRACK EXCAVATOR WITH HAMMER (20 TON) $2,000 $508.30 $1,500.00 |  $475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TRACK DOZER (75 HP) $2,000 $189.97 No Bid No Bid $500 $175.00 $500.00 $200.00
TRACTOR BACKHOE LOADER (75 HP) $2,000 $209.30 $2,000.00 |  $225.00 No Bid No Bid $500.00 $200.00
MOTOR GRADER (200 HP) $2,000 $223.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SKID STEER (75 HP) $2,000 $226.33 $1,500.00 |  $225.00 $500 $150.00 $250.00 $200.00
4 WD WHEEL LOADER (4.75 CY) $2,000 $186.98 No Bid No Bid $500 $175.00 No Bid No Bid
DUMP TRUCK (14 CY) $2,000 $218.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00 $200.00
TRUCK MOUNTED RAIL POST DRIVER No Bid No Bid $1,500 $375 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
VIBRATING DRUM HIGHWAY ROLLER $2,000 $230.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $500.00 $200.00
VIBRATING TRENCH ROLLER $1,800 $205.68 No Bid $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AWD TELEHANDLER BOOM LIFT $2,000 $421.30 No Bid No Bid $500 $175.00 No Bid No Bid
HYDRAULIC CRANE (35 TON TO 200 TON) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $800.00 No Bid No Bid
HYDRAULIC CRANE (MIN 75 TON) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $650.00 No Bid No Bid
HYDRAULIC CRANE (MIN 160 TON) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,000 | $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid
ROUGH TERRIAN HYDRAULIC CRANE (MIN 70 TON) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $700 $400.00 No Bid No Bid
I/R COMPRESSOR TRAILER MOUNTED - - $500.00 $125.00 - -
TRACK EXCAVATOR (40 TON) - - - - - - $1,000.00 |  $375.00
PAVER (SERIES AP1000F) - - - - - - $500.00 $350.00
PAVER (SERIES AP655F) - - - - - - $500.00 $350.00

Equipment in bold were written in by vendor.

Infrastructure Construction
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